Buyer: Kristen Kosch

Department of Administrative Services

5581 OF

Opening Date: 05/26/17

Line #

Carbonless Paper

Omaha Paper Co.

Veritiv

Description

Qty

UoMm

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

-

CB: WHITE 8.5 X 11 UNCOLLATED

175.0000

$ 21.06

$ 3,685.50

$ 23.50

$ 4,112.50

CB: COLOR 8.5 X 11 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

10.0000

$ 21.32

$ 213.20

$ 23.90

$ 239.00

CB: WHITE 8.5 X 14 UNCOLLATED

10.0000

$ 26.96

$ 269.60

$ 29.65

$ 296.50

CB: WHITE 8.5 X 14 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

10.0000

NO BID

NO BID

CB: WHITE 11 X 17 UNCOLLATED

60.0000

$ 42.13

$ 2,527.80

$ 46.95

3 2,817.00

CB: COLOR 11 X 17 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

10.0000

NO BID

NO BID

CB: WHITE 17 5 X 22.5
UNCOLLATED

25.0000

$ 88.98

$ 2,224.50

$ 99.80

$ 2,495.00

CB: WHITE 22.5 X 34.5
UNCOLLATED

30.0000

$ 175.84

$ 5,275.20

$ 196.00

$ 5,880.00

CB: COLOR 22.5X 34.5

UNCOLLATED COLORS:

CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

5.0000

$ 177.97

$ 889.85

$ 198.50

$ 992.50

N
o

CB: WHITE 28.5 X 34.5
UNCOLLATED

10.0000

$ 222.46

$ 2,224.60

$ 249.45

$ 2,494.50

N
o

CFB: WHITE 8.5 X 11 UNCOLLATED

10.0000

$ 25.53

$ 255.30

$ 28.65

$ 286.50

N
N

CFB: COLOR 8.5 X 11 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

75.0000

$ 25.78

$ 1,933.50

$ 28.50

$ 2,137.50

N
w

CFB: WHITE 8.5 X 14 UNCOLLATED

10.0000

$ 32.67

$ 326.70

$ 36.85

$ 368.50

N
N

CFB: COLOR 8.5 X 14 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

10.0000

$ 32.90

$ 329.00

$ 37.00

$ 370.00

N
o

CFB: WHITE 11 X 17 UNCOLLATED

60.0000

$ 51.05

$ 3,063.00

$ 57.25

$ 3,435.00

N
(o2}

CFB: COLOR 11 X 17 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

10.0000

$ 51.55

$ 515.50

$ 57.81

$ 578.10

CFB: WHITE 17.5 X 22.5
UNCOLLATED

10.0000

$ 107.70

$ 1,077.00

$ 120.80

$ 1,208.00

CFB: COLOR 17.5 X 22.5

UNCOLLATED

COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

10.0000

$ 108.77

$ 1,087.70

$ 121.98

$ 1,219.80

CFB: WHITE 22.5 X 34.5
UNCOLLATED

10.0000

$ 213.33

$ 2,133.30

$ 238.70

$ 2,387.00

2l

o

CFB: COLOR 22.5 X 34.5

UNCOLLATED

COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

30.0000

$ 214.96

$ 6,448.80

$ 241.05

$ 7,231.50

2

=

CFB: WHITE 28.5 X 34.5
UNCOLLATED

10.0000

$ 269.26

$ 2,692.60

$ 301.95

$ 3,019.50

2

N

CFB: COLOR 28.5 X 34.5

UNCOLLATED

COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

25.0000

$ 271.94

$ 6,798.50

$ 304.95

$ 7,623.75

2

w

CF: WHITE 8.5 X 11 UNCOLLATED

50.0000

$ 15.07

$ 753.50

$ 16.90

$ 845.00

24

CF: COLOR 8.5 X 11 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

50.0000

$ 15.35

$ 767.50

$ 17.20

$ 860.00

2

o

CF: WHITE 8.5 X 14 UNCOLLATED

110.0000

$ 19.29

$ 2,121.90

$ 21.62

$ 2,378.20

2l

(o2}

CF: COLOR 8.5 X 14 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK,GREEN,
GOLDENROD

5.0000

$ 19.64

$ 98.20

$ 22.05

$ 110.25

2

N

CF: WHITE 11 X 17 UNCOLLATED

5.0000

$ 30.14

$ 150.70

$ 33.80

$ 169.00

2

©

CF: COLOR 11 X 17 UNCOLLATED
COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

5.0000

$ 30.70

$ 153.50

$ 28.75

$ 143.75

2

©

CF: WHITE 17.5 X 22.5
UNCOLLATED

5.0000

$ 63.79

$ 318.95

$ 71.55

$ 357.75

3

o

CF: COLOR 17.5X 22.5

UNCOLLATED

COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

25.0000

$ 64.97

$ 1,624.25

$ 72.85

$ 1,821.25

3

=

CF: WHITE 22.5 X 34.5
UNCOLLATED

5.0000

$ 126.05

$ 630.25

$ 141.35

$ 706.75

3

N

CF: COLOR 22.5X 34.5

UNCOLLATED

COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

50.0000

$ 128.39

$ 6,419.50

$ 143.99

$ 7,199.50

3!

w

CF: WHITE 28.5 X 34.5
UNCOLLATED

5.0000

$ 159.47

$ 797.35

$ 178.50

$ 892.50

3

hN

CF: COLOR 28.5X 34.5

UNCOLLATED

COLORS: CANARY, BLUE, PINK, GREEN,
GOLDENROD

5.0000

$ 162.42

$ 812.10

$ 183.15

$ 915.75

3

o

2-PART 8.5 X 11
STRAIGHT & REVERSE

675.0000

$ 18.70

$ 12,622.50

$ 20.98

$  14,161.50

3

(o2}

2-PART 8.5X 14
STRAIGHT & REVERSE

5.0000

$ 23.94

$ 119.70

$ 26.69

$ 133.45
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Buyer: Kristen Kosch

5581 OF
Department of Administrative Services

Opening Date: 05/26/17

E Carbonless Paper Omaha Paper Co. Veritiv

- Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
37 gﬁ?ﬁéﬂé :?7EVERSE 375.0000 M |$ 3741| $ 14,028.75| $ 4195 $ 15731.25
38 gﬁ:ﬁﬁé;?;ééﬁ/zRSE 200.0000 M |$ 79.31| $ 15,862.00| $ 88,50 $ 17,700.00
39 gﬁ:séjﬁz);gt/zRSE 10.0000 M [$ 156.25( $ 1,562.50| $ 174.20( $ 1,742.00
40 gﬁ:séjiz);gt/zRSE 10.0000 M |$ 197.69( $ 1,976.90| $ 221.69| $ 2,216.90
41 gﬁl’?;é:"f xn 875.0000 M |$ 21.12| $ 18,480.00| $ 2355 $  20,606.25
42 :gcggssés xn 50.0000 M |$ 2112 $ 1,056.00| $ 23.55| $ 1,177.50
43 Zﬁ::é:_f X14 10.0000 M |$ 27.03| $ 270.30| $ 3035| $ 303.50
44 ;—g\l/\;;l’;: X14 5.0000 M |$ 27.03| $ 135.15| $ 30.35( $ 151.75
45 gﬁ::é:':‘rx 17 350.0000 M |$ 4224 $ 14,784.00| $ 4710 $  16,485.00
46 ;-gcggsg xa7 325.0000 M |$ 4224 $ 13,728.00| $ 4710 $ 15,307.50
47 gﬁ:;é;?rs X225 50.0000 M |$ 89.20| $ 4,460.00| $ 99.45| $ 4,972.50
48 :gc;;rsgls X225 175.0000 M [$ 89.20| $ 15,610.00| $ 99.45| $  17,403.75
49 g$£:£:$5 X345 5.0000 M [$ 176.28( $ 881.40| $ 196.50( $ 982.50
50 ;-g\,;\;;rszEz.s X345 5.0000 M |3 176.28( $ 881.40| $ 197.70| $ 988.50
51 g$£:£:$5 X345 5.0000 M $ 223.02| $ 1,115.10| $ 250.10( $ 1,250.50
52 g$£:£:$ xn 50.0000 M [$ 2257| $ 1,128.50| $ 25.30| $ 1,265.00
53 4R-g\¢|§:ss|é5 xn 5.0000 M |$ 2257 $ 112.85( $ 25.30| $ 126.50
54 g$£:£:$ X14 5.0000 M |$ 28.89| $ 144.45| $ 32.40( $ 162.00
55 4R-g\¢|§:ss|é5 X14 5.0000 M |$ 28.89 $ 144.45| $ 32.40( $ 162.00
56 gﬁ;:é:':‘rx 17 10.0000 M |$ 4514| $ 451.40( $ 50.62( $ 506.20
57 ;:OE;SE X7 25.0000 M |$ 4514| $ 1,128.50| $ 50.62( $ 1,265.50
58 gﬁ;:é;?rs X225 5.0000 M NO BID $ - NO BID $ -
59 ;:OE;SE'S X225 40.0000 M |$ 95.30| $ 3,812.00( $ 106.89| $ 4,275.60
60 g¢£:£:$5 X345 5.0000 M NO BID $ - NO BID $ -
61 ;:OE;SZEZ'S X345 5.0000 M |$ 188.34( $ 941.70| $ 21122 $ 1,056.10
62 ;-g\?:;;: xn 25.0000 M [$ 2317( $ 579.25| $ 25.99| $ 649.75
63 ;-g\?:;;: X14 5.0000 M |$ 29.66| $ 148.30( $ 3327 $ 166.35
64 ;-gcggsg xa7 5.0000 M |$ 46.35( $ 231.75| $ 51.98( $ 259.90
65 ;:Oggsg's X225 25.0000 M |$ 97.83| $ 2,445.75( $ 11040 | $ 8,098.75
66 |CF: TAG MANILA 22.5 X 34.5 15.0000 M 377.03 5,655.45 422.80 6,342.00
67 |CF: TAG WHITE 22.5 X 34.5 15.0000 M 377.03 5,655.45 422.80 6,342.00
68 |CF: TAGE WHITE 28.5 X 34.5 15.0000 M 479.05 7,185.75 512.65 7,689.75
69 \ZV?-II'?I'?ERT CFTAG8.5X 11 10.0000 M [$ 4543( $ 454.30( $ 49.75| $ 497.50
70 K/IZI\'TI‘L\ET CFTAG8.5X 11 10.0000 M [$ 4543( $ 454.30( $ 49.75( $ 497.50
71 gﬁig?g:-zEEss COMPOUND ADHESIVE 10.0000 ea | $ 39.75( $ 397.50| $ 48.35( $ 483.50
2 g:;:;‘;';{%ﬁ_‘:;g:s at % Discount 10000.0000 | '$ & 10

Total $  6280.05[$ 206,149.10] $  7,006.55] § 235501.60
Payment Terms 1 30

Delivery Days ARO 30

Comments

Page 2 of 2



